ORDINANCE
W\ c1TY counciL
: CITY AND COUNTY OF HONOLULU

HONOLULU, HAWAII | BILL 3 9 ( 2 0 2 2 )
A BILL FOR AN ORDINANCE

RELATING TO THE ADOPTION OF THE STATE PLUMBING CODE.

BE IT ORDAINED by the People of the City and County of Honolulu:

SECTION 1. Purpose. The purpose of this ordinance is to adopt the Hawai'i
State Plumbing Code, as required by HRS Sec.107-28, subject to local amendments.

SECTION 2. Articles 1 through 6 of Chapter 19, Revised Ordinances of Honolulu
1990 (“Plumbing Code”) are repealed in their entirety.

SECTION 3. Chapter 19, Revised Ordinances of Honolulu 1990 (“Plumbing
Code") is amended by adding a new Atrticle 1 (“*Adoption of the Hawaii State Plumbing
Code”) to read as follows:

“Article 1. Adoption of the Hawaii State Plumbing Code.

Sec. 19-1.1. Adoption of the Hawaii State Plumbing Code.

The Hawai'i State Plumbing Code adopted by the State Building Code Council on
May 19, 2020 (“SPC”) is adopted, incorporated by reference herein, and made a part of
this code, subject to the following amendments;

(1) The unnumbered provisions on page 1 of the SPC that relate to the SPC’s
purpose, scope, definitions, and county permit authorization are deleted: these
provisions are not adopted or incorporated into this code.

(2)  The unnumbered provisions in the SPC regarding the “Adoption of the Uniform
Plumbing Code, 2018 Edition” are amended to read as follows:

Adoption of the Uniform Plumbing Code. The Uniform Plumbing Code, 28th
Edition (2018), 6th Printing (“UPC”) including appendices A, B, C, G and |, as
copyrighted and published by International Association of Plumbing and
Mechanical Officials, 4755 East Philadelphia Street, Ontario, CA 91761-2816
adopted as the State of Hawaii State Plumbing Code and is incorporated herein
by reference, subject to the following amendments.

(3)  UPC Section 101.1 is incorporated into the SPC and is amended to read as
follows:

D-421(22)
ZP



\ CITY COUNCIL

ORDINANCE

C 0) ONOLULU
i o 59(2022)

A BILL FOR AN ORDINANCE

(4)

(©)

(6)

101.1 Title. This document shall be known as the “Plumbing Code,” may be
cited as such, and will be referred to herein as “this code.”

UPC Section 101.2 is incorporated into the SPC and amended to read as
follows:

101.2 Scope. The provisions of this code shall apply to the design, construction,
erection, installation, alteration, repair, relocation, replacement, addition to, use,
or maintenance of plumbing systems within the City and County of Honolulu.

SPC Section 102 (“Organization and Enforcement”) is deleted.

UPC Section 102.1 is incorporated into the SPC and amended to read as follows:
102.1 Conflicts between Codes. In general:

(a) When the provisions of this code conflict with the mechanical code, this
code shall prevail.

(b) When there is a conflict between this code and ROH Chapter 18
concerning the fees or procedural requirements for obtaining a permit
required by this code, Chapter 18 shall prevail except as otherwise stated
herein.

(c) When this code conflicts with ROH Chapter 18 regarding the substantive
requirements for obtaining a permit required by this code, this code shall
prevail except as otherwise stated herein.

(d) When this code conflicts with ROH Chapter 14, Chapter 14 will prevail;
and

(e) Where there is a conflict between a general requirement and a specific
requirement in this code, the specific requirement will prevail. The Authority
Having Jurisdiction may resolve conflicts between the foregoing codes
contrary to the general principals in this section when necessary to prevent
absurd results, prevent unjustified hardship to the applicant, or protect the
health, safety, and welfare of the public.

(f) When this code conflicts with the manufacturer’s installation instructions for
plumbing systems, the Authority Having Jurisdiction shall determine the



ORDINANCE
¥2h CITY COUNCIL

CITY AND COUNTY OF HONOLULU
AII;ONOLULU, HAWAII BILL 3 9 ( 2 0 2 2 )

A BILL FOR AN ORDINANCE

applicable requirements, as necessary for the protection of the public. Where
there is a conflict between a general requirement and a specific requirement
in this code, the specific requirement shall prevail.

(9) Except as otherwise stated herein, conflicts of law are to be resolved in
accordance with the rules of statutory construction and conflicts of law
recognized by Hawaii courts.

(7)  UPC Section 102.2 is incorporated into the SPC and amended to read as follows:

102.2 Existing Installations. Plumbing systems lawfully in existence at the time
of the adoption of this code shall be permitted to have their use, maintenance, or
repair continued provided that they do no create a hazard to health, safety or
property. If replaced, existing showerheads, kitchen faucets, lavatory faucets,
toilets, and urinals shall comply with the water conservation requirements in ROH
Chapter 30, Article 4 (“Water Conservation Measures”).

(8)  UPC Section 103.1 is incorporated into the SPC. UPC Section 103.1 is
amended by replacing its first paragraph with the following:

“The Authority Having Jurisdiction shall be the director of the department of
planning and permitting. In addition to the powers specifically set forth herein,
the Authority Having Jurisdiction shall have all powers reasonably necessary to
administer and enforce this code, including, without limitation, the powers to
render interpretations of this code and adopt and enforce rules that are
supplemental to this code”.

(9)  UPC Section 104.1 is incorporated into the SPC and amended to read as follows:

104.1 Permits Required. It shall be unlawful to alter, install, repair or replace a
plumbing system regulated by this code except as permitted in ROH Section 18-
3.1(b), or to cause the same to be done, without first obtaining a building permit.

In addition to the work exempt from requiring a building permit under this section,
the following work does not require a building permit: (a) the clearing of
stoppages and blocks without the removal or replacement of plumbing systems
or parts thereof; and (b) the removal and replacement of water closets, shower
heads, and faucets without the replacement or rearrangement of valves, pipes,
and other plumbing system components.



CITY COUNCIL

ORDINANCE

Gl G e 39(2022)

A BILL FOR AN ORDINANCE

(10)

(11)

(12)

(13)

(14)

Exemption from permit requirements under ROH Section 18-3.1(b) shall not be
deemed to grant authorization for work to be done in violation of the other
requirements of the code or any other laws or ordinances.

UPC Section 104.2 (Exempt Work) is incorporated into the SPC and is deleted: it
is not made a part of this code.

UPC Section 104.3 (“Application for Permit”) is incorporated into the SPC, and is
deleted; permit applications shall be governed by ROH Chapter 18.

UPC Section 104.3.1 is incorporated into the SPC and amended to read as follows:

104.3.1 Construction Documents. In addition to the requirements provided in
ROH Chapter 18, construction documents that are submitted with an application
for a permit must:

(a) Provide a true and accurate description of the work that will be
performed,;

(b) Include piping plans with isometric piping diagrams, equipment piping
details, equipment schedules, and product information;

(c) Be drawn to standard architectural scale using floor plans and
elevations or standard engineering scale appropriate to site utilities:

(d) Use text with a minimum height of one-eighth inch; and

(e) Be prepared, stamped, and signed by a professional civil or
mechanical engineer, licensed to practice in the State of Hawaii.

UPC Sections 104.3.2 (“Plan Review Fees”), 104.3.3 (“Time Limitation of
Application”), 104.4 (“Permit Issuance”), 104.4.1 (Approved Plans or
Construction Documents”), 104.4.2 (“Validity of Permit”), 104.4.4 (“Extensions”),
104.4.5 (“Suspension or Revocation”). 104.4.6 (“Retention of Plans”), and 104.5
(‘Fees”) are incorporated into the SPC and deleted. The subjects addressed by
these provisions are governed by ROH Chapter 18.

UPC Section 104.5.1 is incorporated into the SPC and amended to read as follows:

104.5.1 Work Commencing Before Permit Issuance. Where work for which a
permit is required by this code has been commenced without first obtaining a



ORDINANCE
\ CITY COUNCIL

ITY AND COUNTY OF HONOLULU ( )
¢ H(l))NOLULU, HAWAII BILL 3 9 2 0 2 2

A BILL FOR AN ORDINANCE

building permit, a special investigation may be made required before a permit is
issued for such work.

(15) UPC Section 104.5.2 is incorporated into the SPC and deleted. This section is
not adopted or incorporated into this code.

(16) UPC Section 104.5.3 (“Fee Refunds”) is incorporated into the SPC and deleted.
Refunds for fees collected in connection with applications for permits required by
this code are governed by ROH Chapter 18.

(17) UPC Section 105.2.3 is incorporated into the SPC and amended to read as
follows:

105.2.3 Inspection Requests. It shall be the duty of the person doing the work
authorized by a permit to notify the Authority Having Jurisdiction that such work is
ready for inspection. A request for inspection may be made in any manner
allowed by the Authority Having Jurisdiction but must be made not less than two
working days before the desired inspection date. If a request is properly made,
the Authority Having Jurisdiction shall not be required to perform the inspection
on the requested date, but shall make reasonable efforts to perform the
requested inspection on the requested date or as soon thereafter as is
practicable under the circumstances.

It shall be the duty of the person requesting inspections, in accordance with this
code, to provide access to and means for inspection of such work. After
inspection, the Authority Having Jurisdiction shall approve the inspected work if it
complies with the requirements of this code and the approved plans for the
building permit issued for the work.

As part of any inspection made under this code, the Authority Having Jurisdiction
may require verification that the work being inspected was performed by a
currently licensed plumbing journey worker and/or contractor. The failure to
verify that work under inspection was performed by an appropriately licensed
professional will be good and adequate grounds for the Authority Having
Jurisdiction to determine that the work fails inspection.

In addition to any fees payable under ROH Chapter 18, a person requesting an
inspection will be required to pay an inspection fee. A person may request an
inspection to occur during normal business hours shall pay the city a fee of
$50.00 per hour for the time that is used to perform the inspection, which will
including time used to travel to and from the inspection location. A person may



| ORDINANCE
CITY COUNCIL
J cTy A}I;J(l))NCOCiIIJJI;IJTJﬁ,! }?If‘;’{gfoww BILL 3 9 ( 2 0 22 )

A BILL FOR AN ORDINANCE

also request an inspection outside of normal business hours. A request for an
inspection outside of normal business hours may be approved or denied at the
discretion of the Authority Having Jurisdiction, based on the nature of the work to
be inspected and the availability of personnel to perform the inspection. The fee
for an inspection outside of normal business hours is $75.00 for each hour that is
used to perform the inspection, including time used to travel to and from the
inspection location. For the purposes of this section, normal business hours are
8:00 a.m. to 4:00 p.m. on a day on which the city is open for business.

In calculating inspection fees due under this section, the person requesting the
inspection will be billed for one hour of time for inspections that take up to one
hour and half the hourly rate for each additional half hour or portion thereof used
to perform the inspection.

(1‘8) UPC Section 105.2.4 is incorporated into the SPC, and of the UPC, adopted by
the SPC, is amended to read:

105.2.4 Advance Notice. It shall be the duty of the person doing the work
authorized by a permit to notify the Authority Having Jurisdiction that such work is
ready for inspection. Such notification shall be given not less than 2 working
days before the work is to be inspected. Such notification shall be in writing or by
telephone, at the option of the Authority Having Jurisdiction.

(19) UPC Section 105.2.6 is incorporated into the SPC and amended to read as
follows:

105.2.6 Reinspections. If an inspection is made by the Authority Having
Jurisdiction and additional inspections are necessary because less than all of the
work requiring inspection is approved, the Authority Having Jurisdiction may
require a reinspection of the work that has not been approved. When a
resinspection is required, a reinspection fee will be assessed.

Reinspections may be requested in the same manner as requests for initial
inspections under Section 105.2.3 and will be billed in the same manner
described therein.

Reinspections will not be provided until all outstanding inspection fees and the
fee for reinspection have been paid.

(20) UPC Section 105.2 is incorporated into the SPC, and is amended by adding
Subsection 105.2.7 to read:



Y CITY COUNCIL

ORDINANCE

o ONOLULY, HAWAD s 39(2022)

A BILL FOR AN ORDINANCE

21)

105.2.7 Plumbing Special Inspection. The Authority Having Jurisdiction may
require work governed by this code to be subject to Plumbing Special Inspection
when deemed necessary based on the nature of the work or resources of the
department. Plumbing Special Inspections must be performed by appropriately
licensed design professionals that are not involved in performing the work that
will be inspected.

Plumbing Special Inspectors are to be hired and paid by the applicant and may
be required to provide the Authority Having Jurisdiction with proof of their
qualifications to perform the required inspections.

Plumbing Special Inspectors shall review the approved construction documents
prior to the commencement of work and document the performance of work in
compliance with the approved construction documents and the requirements of
this code in reports that will be provided to the Authority Having Jurisdiction, the
applicant, and the registered professional engineer or architect of record on
request.

When work that is subject to a Plumbing Special Inspection is complete, the
Plumbing Special Inspector shall submit a final signed report stating that the
inspected work was completed in compliance with the approved construction
documents and the requirements of this code.

Plumbing Special Inspectors will provide written documentation to the building
official demonstrating his or her competence and relevant experience or training
in each type of inspection they will perform. Inspector personnel will not be
allowed to perform inspections without these qualifications unless directly
supervised by the qualified, responsible Plumbing Special Inspector.

UPC Section 106.2 is incorporated into the SPC and is amended to read as
follows:

106.2 Notices of Violation and Order. Whenever any person, firm, or
corporation violates any provision of this chapter, the Authority Having
Jurisdiction may serve a notice of violation on the persons deemed responsible
for the violation, which may include the owners of the property and building or
unit thereof. A notice of violation must be served on the responsible persons by:

(a) Hand delivery to the responsible person at any location or to another person
of suitable age and discretion at the responsible person’s workplace or place of



W cITY counciL

ORDINANCE

CITY AND COUNTY OF HONOLULU
. H(I))NOLULU, HAWAII - BILL 3 9 ( 2 0 2 2 )

A BILL FOR AN ORDINANGCE

residence or

(b) Certified mail, deliverable to any address at which the responsible person is
known to receive mail, with return receipt requested. However, if the
whereabouts of one or more responsible persons are unknown and cannot be
readily ascertained by the Authority Having Jurisdiction, the Authority Having
Jurisdiction may, after reasonable efforts to locate and serve the responsible
person as provided for in (a) and (b), serve the notice of violation by publishing a
copy of the same in a daily or weekly publication of general circulation within in
the city, one per week for two consecutive weeks.

A notice of violation must include at least the following information:
(a)  The date of the notice;
(b)  The name of the persons deemed responsible for the violation;

(c)  The section of the code, the rule, or the permit condition that has
been violated;

(d) A concise statement or description of the violation;
(e)  The deadline for correcting each violation; and

) The name and phone number of the inspector responsible for
issuing the notice of violation.

If a violation remains uncorrected after a notice of violation is served on one or
more responsible persons, the Authority Having Jurisdiction may then issue a
notice of order to the same persons who were served with the notice of violation.

A notice of order must contain the same information required for a notice of
violation and may impose civil fines of up to $2,000.00 per violation, per day for
each uncorrected violation that was identified in the notice of violation. In
addition to the information required in a notice of violation, a notice of order must
inform the responsible persons that the notice of order may be appealed to the
Building Board of Appeals within thirty days of service of the notice of order.
Notices of order must be served in the same manner as notices of violation.

Service of a notice of violation or notice of order will be effective:
(a) on the day hand delivery is made;



Y <

ORDINANCE
ITY COUNCIL

b s 39(2022)

A BILL FOR AN ORDINANCE

(22)

(23)

(b) on the day certified mail is signed for; or
(c) on the date the last required publication is made.

UPC Section 106.3 is incorporated into the SPC and is amended to read as
follows:

106.3 Criminal Penalties. Any person, firm, or corporation violating any of the
provision of this code shall be guilty of a misdemeanor, with each days
continuance of the violation deemed a separate offense. The penalty for a
criminal violation of this code shall be a fine of not more than $2,000.00 per
violation, imprisonment for not more than one year, or by both.

Any officer or inspector designated by the Authority Having Jurisdiction that has
been deputized by the chief of police as a special officer for the purpose of
enforcing the provisions of the this code may arrest the person responsible for
the violation upon a warrant of arrest or issue a citation using a summons and
complaint form issued by the judiciary for violations of this code. The form and
content of such summons and complaint form shall be as adopted or prescribed
by the administrative judge of the district court and shall be printed on a form
commensurate with the form of other summonses or citations used in modern
methods of arrest, so designed to include all necessary information to make the
same valid within the laws and regulations of the State of Hawaii and the City
and County of Honolulu.

UPC Section 106.4 is incorporated into the SPC, and is amended to read as
follows

106.4 Stop Orders. If the Authority Having Jurisdiction determines that work is
being done in violation to this code or any permit issued hereunder, the Authority
Having Jurisdiction may issue a written stop work order to the owner of the
property, building, and building unit and to any persons engaged in or causing
the work to be done. Upon service of a stop work order, all persons served with
the order must immediately stop work until the Authority Having Jurisdiction
authorizes further work.

In addition to the information required for a notice of violation under Section
106.2, a stop work order must contain a concise description of the work that is
prohibited by the stop work order. A stop work order may be served in the same
manner as a notice of violation or notice of order under Section 106.2. The
provisions in Section 106.2 regarding the effective date of service will apply to
stop work orders.



b\ cITY councIL

ORDINANCE

T ap ot of Y e 39(2022)

A BILL FOR AN ORDINANCE

(24)

(25)

(26)

(27)

UPC Section 106.0 is incorporated into the SPC and is amended by adding
Subsection 106.7.2 to read as follows:

106.7.2 Effect of Order--Right to Appeal.

All orders issued by the Authority Having Jurisdiction will become final 30
calendar days after the date of service. Any person served with an order issued
under this code may appeal the order to the Building Board of Appeals before
that time. The filing of an appeal will not stay any provision of the order being
appealed.

UPC Section 106.0 is incorporated into the SPC and is amended by adding
Subsection 106.7.3 to read as follows:

106.7.3 Judicial Enforcement.

The Authority Having Jurisdiction may institute a civil action in any court of
competent jurisdiction to enjoin any violation of this code and any rule adopted or
permit issued hereunder.

The Authority Having Jurisdiction may also institute a civil action to enforce the
civil fine imposed by an order that has become final. In such cases, the Authority
Having Jurisdiction need only show that the notice of violation and order were
properly served, that a civil fine was imposed, the amount of the civil fine that it
seeks to enforce, and that the fine has not been paid.

UPC Section 107.1 is incorporated into the SPC and is amended to read as
follows: :

107.1 Building Board of Appeals.

The Building Board of Appeals constituted under the ROH Chapter 16 shall have
the authority hear and determine appeals from the actions of the Authority
Having Jurisdiction in the administration and enforcement of this code. The
procedures and standards for appeals from the actions of the Authority Having
Jurisdiction in the administration and enforcement of this code will be as provided
in ROH Chapter 16.

UPC Section 107.2 (“Limitations of Authority”) is incorporated into the SPC and
deleted. This section is not adopted or incorporated into this code.

10



CITY COUNCIL ORDINANCE
§  CITY AND COUNTY OF HONOLULU 2 9 ( 2 0 2 2 )
HONOLULU, HAWAII BILL

A BILL FOR AN ORDINANCE

(28) UPC Section 203.0 is incorporated into the SPC, and is amended to read as
follows:

“Authority Having Jurisdiction” means the Director of the Department of
Planning and Permitting, of the City and County of Honolulu. When references
are to the Health Officer, Health Department or Health, the Authority Having
Jurisdiction shall be the Director of Health of the Department of Health, State of

Hawaii.

(29) UPC Section 204.0 is incorporated into the SPC, and is amended by adding the
definition of “Building Code” and amending the definition of “Building Drain” to
read as follows:

“Building Code.” As defined in ROH § 16-1.1(1), as amended.

(30) UPC Section 205.0 is incorporated into the SPC, and is amended by adding the
following definition in the appropriate alphabetical arrangement:

“Control Valve.” A control valve is any type of valve which can change the flow
rate of water, which includes compression stop valves.

(31) UPC Section 206.0 is incorporated into the SPC, and is amended by adding the
following definitions in the appropriate alphabetical arrangement:

“DOH.” means the State of Hawaii, Department of Health

“Dwelling.” means a house, apartment, or other place that is intended to provide
living accommodations to one or more persons and equipped with amenities for
sleeping, cooking, and sanitation

(32) UPC Section 220.0 is incorporated into the SPC, and is amended to read as
follows:

“Registered professional engineer.” An engineer licensed in the State of
Hawaii under Chapter 464 Professional Engineers, Architects, Surveyors and
Landscape Architects.

(33) UPC Section 221.0 is incorporated into the SPC, and is amended by adding the
following definitions in the appropriate alphabetical arrangement:

11



N ORDINANCE
)Nt CITY COUNCIL

R ONOLULU, AWATL s 39202 2)

A BILL FOR AN ORDINANCE

“SPC.” means the Hawaii State Plumbing Code, adopted by the State Building
Code Council on May 19, 2020.

(34) UPC Section 223.0 is incorporated into the SPC, and is amended by the addition
of the following definition to be located in the appropriate alphabetical
arrangement:

“UPC”. Means the 2018 Uniform Plumbing Code, 28th Edition (2018), 6th
Printing.

(35) UPC Section 301.4 is incorporated into the SPC, and is amended to read:

301.4 Flood Hazard Areas. Plumbing systems that are located in special flood
hazard area, floodway area, or flood fringe area identified in ROH Chapter 21A
must be designed and installed so that water will not enter or accumulate within
their components during flooding. Plumbing systems located below the base
fiood elevation shall be designed and installed to resist hydrostatic and
hydrodynamic loads and stresses, including the effects of buoyancy. All pipe
openings shall terminate at an elevation of at least one foot above the base flood
elevation unless the drainage system is equipped with an automatic backwater
valve in each discharge line passing through the building exterior wall. Fixtures
located at a floor level above the base flood elevation shall not discharge through
the backwater valve. ‘

(36) UPC Section 301.5.1 is incorporated into the SPC, and is amended to read as
follows:

301.5.1 Permit Application. In addition to the requirements of ROH Chapter 18,
the following will apply to applications for building permits involving alternative
engineered designs. The registered professional engineer shall indicate on the
design documents that the plumbing system, or part thereof, is an alternative
engineered design and note the same in the building permit application. The
permit and permanent permit records must indicate that an alternative
engineered design was part of the approved installation. A written request by a
registered professional mechanical engineer with the concurrence of the building
or project owner must be made to the Authority Having Jurisdiction. The details
of this approval shall be recorded and entered in the files of the department.
Submittals shall be stamped and signed by the registered professional
mechanical engineer. The registered professional mechanical engineer
responsible for the design supervision and construction observation of the
system shall provide a statement that they have personally verified all tests and

12



{3} CITY COUNCIL

ORDINANCE

i R e o e 39(2022)

A BILL FOR AN ORDINANCE

(37)

(38)

(39)

(40)

(41)

certifications and, if appropriate, state that the installation complies with the
installation requirements.

UPC Section 301.5.6 is incorporated into the SPC, and is amended to read as
follows:

301.5.6 Inspection and Testing. Plumbing Special Inspections, as specified in
Section 105.2.7 will be required for work involving alternative engineered
designs. The alternative engineered design will be tested and inspected in
accordance with the submitted testing and inspection plan and the requirements
of this code.

UPC Section 306.0 is incorporated into the SPC, and is amended by adding
Subsection 306.3 to read as follows:

306.3 Industrial Wastewater Discharge Permits. Sanitary sewer systems that
require an industrial wastewater discharge permit under ROH Chapter 14 must
comply with the design and maintenance requirements adopted by the
Department of Environmental Services.

UPC Section 310.4 is incorporated into the SPC, and is amended to read as
follows.

310.4 Use of Vent and Waste Pipes. Except as hereinafter provided in Section
908.0 Wet Venting, Section 909.0 Special Venting for Island Fixtures, Section
910.0 Combination Waste and Vent Systems, no vent pipe shall be used as a
soil or waste pipe, nor shall a soil or waste pipe be used as a vent.

UPC Section 312.3 is incorporated into the SPC, and is amended to read as
follows:

312.3 Building Sewer and Drainage Piping. No building sewer or other
drainage piping or part thereof, constructed of materials other than those
approved for use under or within a building, shall be installed under or within 5
feet (1.5m) of any building or structure, less than one foot (0.3m) below the
surface of the ground or as approved by the authority having jurisdiction.

UPC Section 312.7 is incorporated into the SPC, and is amended to read as
follows:

13



N\ ORDINANCE
N\ CITY coUNcIL

Y HoNOLULU, tawAT sr 39(2022)

A BILL FOR AN ORDINANCE

312.7 Fire-Resistant Construction. Piping penetrations of fire-resistance-rated
walls, partitions, floors, floor/ceiling assemblies, roof/ceiling assemblies, or shaft
enclosures shall be protected in accordance with the requirements of the building
code.

(42) UPC Section 317.0, Food-Handling Establishments, including Subsection 317.1
are incorporated into the UPC, are deleted.

(43) UPC Section 408.2 is incorporated into the SPC, and is amended to read as
follows:

408.2 Water Consumption. A showerheads shall have a maximum flow rate of
not more than 1.8 gallons per minute (gpm) at 80 psi (6.8 L/m at 552 kPa).

(44) UPC Section 411.2 is incorporated into the SPC, and is amended to read as
follows:

411.2 Water Consumption. A water closets shall have a maximum
consumption not to exceed 1.28 gallons (6.8 liters/minute) of water per flush.

(45) UPC Section 411.2.2 is incorporated into the SPC, and is amended to read as
follows:

411.2.2 Flushometer Valve Activated Water Closets. Flushometer valve
activated water closets shall have a maximum flush volume of 1.28 gallons (4.8
liters) of water per flush.

(46) UPC Section 415.2 (“Drinking Fountain Alternatives”) is incorporated into the
SPC, and is deleted from this code.

(47)  UPC Section 422.0 is incorporated into the SPC, and is amended to read as
follows:

Minimum Number of Required Fixtures. Plumbing fixtures shall be provided
for the type of building occupancy and in the minimum number required in the
Building Code. -

(48) UPC Section 422.1 and UPC Table 422.1 are incorporated into the SPC, and are
deleted from this code.

14



ORDINANCE
Yoo CITY COUNCIL

Y HoNOLULY, BAWAT s 39(2022)

A BILL FOR AN ORDINANCE

(49) UPC Section 501.1 is incorporated into the SPC, and is amended to read as
follows:

501.1 Applicability. The regulations of chapter 5 of this code shall govern the
construction, location, and installation of fuel-burning and other types of water
heaters heating potable water, together with chimneys, vents, and their
connectors. The minimum capacity for storage water heaters shall be in
accordance with the first-hour rating listed in Table 501.1(2). No water heater
shall be hereinafter installed that does not comply with the manufacturer's
installation instructions and the type and model of each size thereof approved by
the Authority Having Jurisdiction. A list of accepted water heater appliance
standards is referenced in Table 501.1(1). Listed appliances shall be installed in
accordance with manufacturer installation instructions.

(50) UPC Section 601.2 is incorporated into the SPC, and is amended to read as
follows:

601.2 Hot and Cold Water Required. Except where not deemed necessary for
safety or sanitation by the Authority Having Jurisdiction, each plumbing fixture
shall be provided with an adequate supply of potable running water piped thereto
in an approved manner, so arranged as to flush and keep it in a clean and
sanitary condition without danger of backflow or cross-connection. Water closets
and urinals shall be flushed using an approved flush tank or flushometer valve.

Exception: Listed fixtures that do not require water for their operation and are
not connected to the water supply.

(1) UPC Section 601.0 is incorporated into the SPC, and is amended by adding
Subsection 601.4 to read as follows:

601.4 Private Water Systems. Owners of private water systems are
responsible for maintaining the potability of their water systems. Private water
systems apply to water systems that are not defined as public water systems as
defined by the health officer.

(52) UPC Section 603.5.5 is incorporated into the SPC, and is amended by adding
subparagraph (4) to read as follows:

(4) No gravity tank may be directly connected to the city water main. Gravity
tanks must be provided with an over-the-rim filler, the orifice or outlet of

15



CITY COUNCIL

ORDINANCE

T ONOLUL, WAL pr. 39202 2)

A BILL FOR AN ORDINANCE

(53)

(54)

(59)

(56)

(57)

which must be elevated a distance of six inches (152 .4 mm) above the
overflow. A drain shall be provided at the bottom of the tank.

UPC Section 603.5.14 is incorporated into the SPC, and is amended by adding
the following to the list of enumerated items thereunder:

603.5.14 Protection from Fire Systems.
(5) Systems with alarm check valve assembly.
(6) Systems with booster pump and check valve assembly.

UPC Section 610.4 is incorporated into the SPC and is amended to read as
follows:

610.4 Sizing Water Supply and Distribution Systems. Except as otherwise
required by the Board of Water Supply, systems within the range of Table 610.4
may be sized as described therein or as provided in Section 610.5 of this code.

UPC Sections 612.0 to 612.7 are incorporated into the SPC, and are deleted
from this code. Residential fire sprinkler requirements are to be determined by
the Building Code.

UPC Section 701.2, Subparagraph (2) is incorporated into the SPC, and is
amended to read as follows:

(2) ABS and PVC DWV piping installations must be installed in accordance
with applicable standards referenced in Table 701.2, provided that
“Firestop Protection” requirements will be determined by the Building
Code. Except for single-family dwellings, materials exposed within ducts
or plenums must -have a flame-spread index of a maximum of 25 and a
smoke-developed index maximum of 50, where tested in accordance with
ASTM E 84 and UL 723. These tests must comply with all requirements
of the standards to include the sample size, both for width and length.
Plastic pipe may not be tested while filled with water.

UPC Section 704.3 is in incorporated into the SPC, and is amended to read as
follows:

16



, ORDINANCE
W CITY COUNCIL

S fovoLury, mawal e 39(2022)

A BILL FOR AN ORDINANCE

704.3 Commercial Sinks. Sinks in commercial kitchens and food service
establishments must comply with the requirements adopted by the Health
Official.

(68) UPC Section 707 is incorporated into the SPC, and is amended by adding
Subsection 707.15 to read:

707.15 Residential Cleanouts. All cleanouts located on the ground floor within
any residential occupancy shall be extended outside of the building, arranged in
an accessible location below the building, or above the floor, and extend no less
than six inches (152.4 mm) above the flood level rim of the lowest fixture.

(59) UPC Section 710.6 is incorporated into the SPC and is amended to read as
follows: '

710.6 Backwater Valves. Backwater valves, gate valves, fullway ball valves,
unions, motors, compressors, air tanks, and other mechanical devices required
by this section must be located where they will be accessible for inspection and
repair. Unless continuously exposed, these items must be enclosed in a masonry
pit fitted with an adequately sized removable cover or other approved
compartment.

Backwater valves must:
(a) Have bodies of cast-iron, plastic, brass, or other approved materials;
(b) Have noncorrosive bearings, seats, and self-aligning discs; and

(c) Be constructed so as to ensure a positive mechanical seal. Backwater
valves must remain open during periods of low flows to avoid screening of
solids and shall not restrict capacities or cause excessive turbulence during
peak loads. Unless otherwise listed, valve access covers must be a bolted
type with gasket, and each valve must bear the manufacturer's name cast
into the body and the cover.

(60) UPC Section 713.1 is incorporated into the SPC and is amended to read as
follows:

Where Required. A building in which plumbing fixtures are installed and

premises having drainage piping thereon must be connected to a public or
private sewer, except as provided in ROH Chapter 14.

17



N\ CITY COUNCIL

ORDINANCE

CITY AND COUNTY OF HONOLULU
HONOLULU, HAWAII BILL 9 9 ‘ 2 022 )

A BILL FOR AN ORDINANCE

(61)

(62)

(63)

(64)

(65)

(66)

UPC Section 713.2 (“Private Sewage Disposal System”) is incorporated into the
SPC and deleted from this code. The use of private sewage disposal systems is
allowed under the circumstances described in ROH Chapter 14.

UPC Section 713.3 is incorporated into the SPC and is amended to read as
follows:

713.3 Public Sewer. The rearrangement or subdivision of a lot into smaller
parcels will not be deemed adequate cause to permit the construction of a private
sewage disposal system.

UPC Section 713.4 (“Public Sewer Availability”) is incorporated into the SPC and
is deleted from this code. The availability of public sewers will be determined in
accordance with ROH Chapter 14.

UPC Section 713.5 is incorporated into the SPC, and is amended to read as
follows:

713.5 Permit. No permit shall be issued for the installation, alteration, or repair
of a private sewage disposal system, or part thereof, on a lot for which a
connection with a public sewer is available. It is unlawful for any person to use or
connect to the public sewer system without first obtaining the written approval of
the Authority Having Jurisdiction.

UPC Section 713.7 is incorporated into the SPC, and is amended to read as
follows:

713.7 Installation. The installation of building sewers receiving building permits
from the Authority Having Jurisdiction must comply with this code. Where a
building sewer is lawfully installed without a building permit from the Authority
Having Jurisdiction because the building sewer is regulated by another
governmental entity, the provisions of this code relating to building sewers need

not apply.

UPC Section 713.0 is incorporated into the SPC, and is amended by adding
Subsection 713.8 to read as follows:

713.8 Building Sewer Construction. Building sewer construction shall conform
to the requirements for main line sewers as set forth in the City and County of

18



ORDINANCE

CITY COUNCIL
j cry AggN%%%ﬁg 1?: ‘;lgr:oww BILL 39 ( 202 2 )
A BILL FOR AN ORDINANCE

Honolulu Wastewater System Standard Details, dated July 2017, and ROH
Chapter 14 Public Works Infrastructure Requirements Including Fees and
Services, as amended, when either of the following conditions exists:

(1) Where the Authority Having Jurisdiction requires such construction
because of the character or quantity of the sewage or industrial waste to
be discharged.

(2) Where the sewer will be dedicated to the City and County of Honolulu.

(67) UPC Sections 714.1 (“Unlawful Practices”), 714.2 (“Prohibited Wastewater
Discharge”), and 714.3 (“Prohibited Sewer Connection”) are incorporated into the
SPC and are deleted from this code. These topics are governed by ROH
Chapter 14.

(68) UPC Section 718.3 is incorporated into the SPC and is amended to read as
follows:

718.3 Protection from Damage. No building sewer or other drainage piping or
part thereof, which is constructed of materials other than those approved for use
under of within a building, may be installed within 5 feet (1.5 m) of any part of a
building or structure, nor less than 1 foot (305 mm) below the surface of the
ground. The provisions of this subsection include structures such as porches
and steps, whether covered or uncovered; breezeways; roofed porte cocheres:
roofed patios; carports; covered walks; covered driveways; and similar structures
or appurtenances.

(69) UPC Subsection 722.2 is incorporated into the SPC and is amended by adding
the following Exception:

Exception: An abandoned cesspool is allowed to be used as an overflow
receptor for a sewage sump with pump discharge when approved by the
Authority Having Jurisdiction.

(70) UPC Subsection 804.1 is incorporated into the SPC and is amended to read as
follows:

804.1 Standpipe Receptors. Plumbing fixtures or other receptors receiving the
discharge of indirect waste pipes may be approved and must be of such shape

and capacity as to prevent splashing or flooding. Where approved, such fixtures
and receptors must be located in a readily accessible location for inspection and

19



ORDINANCE
h CITY COUNCIL
e o mu 39(2022)

A BILL FOR AN ORDINANCE

cleaning. No standpipe receptor for a clothes washer may extend more than 30
inches (762 mm) above its trap. No standpipe receptor for a clothes washer may
be less than 18 inches (457 mm) above its trap. No trap for a clothes washer
standpipe receptor may be installed below the floor. Stand pipe receptors must
be roughed in not less than six inches (152 m) and not more than 18 inches (457
mm) above the floor. No indirect waste receptor may be installed in a toilet room,
closet, cupboard, or storeroom, nor in a portion of a building not in general use
by the occupants thereof; except standpipes for clothes washers may be
permitted to be installed in toilet and bathroom areas where the clothes washer is
installed in the same room. Indirect drain receptors for air conditioning
condensate drain lines must be accessible without the use of tools or equipment
for inspection and cleaning and are allowed to be installed in toilet or bathroom
areas.

(71) UPC Subsection 809.1 is incorporated into the SPC and is amended to read as
follows:

809.1 General. Drinking fountains may be permitted with indirect waste.
Outdoor drinking fountains located beyond 200 feet from nearest sanitary
drainage system may be allowed to discharge into a dry well in accordance with
the dry well detail of the City and County of Honolulu, Department of Parks and
Recreation.

(72) UPC Subsection 814.5 is incorporated into the SPC and is amended to read as
follows:

814.5 Point of Discharge. Air-conditioning condensate waste pipes must
connect indirectly, except where permitted in Section 814.6, to the drainage
system through an air gap or air break to trapped and vented receptors, dry
wells, leach pits, or the tailpiece of plumbing fixtures. A condensate drain must
be trapped in accordance with the appliance manufacturer's instructions or as
approved. Dry wells shall have an inner pipe diameter greater than or equal to
the total excavated depth to the bottom of fill.

(73) UPC, Subsection 903.1 is incorporated into the SPC: with Subparagraph
903.1(2) amended to read as follows:

(2) ABS and PVC DWV piping installations shall be in accordance with the
"Firestop Protection" requirements of the Building Code. Except for
individual single-family dwelling, materials exposed within ducts or
plenums shall have a flame-spread index of not more than 25 and a

20



ORDINANCE
\ CITY COUNCIL

COUNTY OF HONOLULU ( )
cry AI-I;I(I))NOL%NLU, H:WAH Y BILL 592022

A BILL FOR AN ORDINANCE

smoke-developed index of not more than 50 where tested in accordance
with ASTM E84 or UL 723. These tests shall comply with all requirements
of the standards to include the sample size, both for width and length.
Plastic pipe shall not be tested filled with water.

(74) UPC Subsections 908.2 (“Horizontal Wet Venting for Bathroom Groups”)
inclusive of subparagraphs 908.2.1 through 908.2.5 are incorporated into the
SPC and are deleted from this code.

(75) UPC Subsection 911.0 (“Circuit Venting”) inclusive of subparagraphs 911.1
through 911.5 are incorporated into the SPC are deleted from this code.

(76) UPC Subsection 911.0 (“Circuit Venting”) inclusive of subparagraphs 911.1
through 911.5 are incorporated into the SPC are deleted from this code.

(77)  UPC Subsection 1201.1 is incorporated into the SPC, and is amended to read as
follows:

1201.1 Applicability. The regulations of this chapter shall govern the installation
of fuel gas piping in or in connection with a building, structure or within the
property lines of premises up to 5 pounds-force per square inch (psi) (34 kPa) for
natural gas and 10 psi (69 kPa) for undiluted propane, other than service pipe.

(78) UPC Subsection 1203.0 (“Inspection”) inclusive of Subparagraphs 1203.1
through 1203.4 are incorporated into the SPC, and are deleted from this code.
Inspections are to be performed in accordance with Subsection 105.0 of this
code.

(79) UPC Subsections 1204.1 (“Issuance”) and 1204.2 (“Gas Supplier”) are
incorporated into the SPC, and are deleted from this code.

(80) UPC Subsection 1204.3 is incorporated into the SPC and is amended to read as
follows:

1204.3 Unlawful. It is unlawful for a gas supplier or person acting as a gas
supplier to furnish gas or to cause gas to be turned on before the gas system has
passed final inspection.

(81) UPC Subsection 1208.1 is incorporated into the SPC and is amended to read as
follows:

21



W CITY COUNCIL

ORDINANCE

O e O HONOLULU s 39(2022)

A BILL FOR AN ORDINANCE

(82)

(83)

(84)

(85)

1208.1 Installation of Piping System. The Authority Having Jurisdiction may
require a piping plan before proceeding with installation. The plan must show the
proposed location of piping, the size of different branches, the various load
demands, and the location of the point of delivery. Gas meters may not be
located under a window, under interior or exterior stairways, or in engine, boiler,
heater or electric meter rooms.

UPC Section 1210.2 is incorporated into the SPC, and is amended to read as
follows:

1210.2 Installation of Piping. Piping installed above ground shall be securely
supported and located where it will be protected from physical damage. All
exposed gas piping must be kept at least six inches (152 mm) above grade or
structure. Where passing through an exterior wall, the piping must be protected
against corrosion by coating or wrapping with an inert material approved for such
applications. The piping must be sealed around its circumference at the point of
the exterior penetration to prevent the entry of water, insects, and rodents.
Where piping is encased in a protective pipe sleeve, the annular spaces between
the gas piping and the sleeve and between the sleeve and the wall opening must
be sealed.

UPC Section 1319.0 is incorporated into the SPC, and is amended by adding
Subsection 1319.4 to read as follows:

1319.4 Approval. In addition to requirements imposed by ROH Chapter 18,
plans for medical gas and vacuum systems must be stamped and signed by
registered professional mechanical or civil engineer. The registered professional
mechanical or civil engineer responsible for the design and construction
observation of the medical gas and vacuum system must, upon project
completion, provide a statement to the Authority Having Jurisdiction indicating
that they have personally verified that the as built system complies with the
approved plans and other requirements of this code. Medical gas and vacuum
systems must be tested and inspected by a Plumbing Special Inspector.

UPC Chapter 14 (“Firestop Protection”) is deleted in the entirety. The
requirements for firestopping must comply with the requirements of the Building
Code.

UPC Section1501.2 is incorporated into the SPC, and is amended to read as
follows:

22



)N&\ CITY COUNCIL

Y HoNoLULU, HAwA s 39(2022)

A BILL FOR AN ORDINANCE

1501.2 System Design. Alternate water source systems must be designed by a
registered professional mechanical or civil engineer licensed to perform building
and site plumbing design work. Components, piping, and fittings used in an
alternate water source system must be specified in plans and construction
documents. The professional mechanical and civil engineers are responsible for
the design and observation of the alternate water source system and must, upon
project completion, provide a statement to the Authority Having Jurisdiction
indicating that they have personally verified that the as built system complies with
the approved plans and the requirements of this code. Alternate water source
systems must be tested and inspected by a Plumbing Special Inspector.

Exception:

When project exempt from licensing requirements of HRS Chapter 464, the
registered professional engineer is not required for single family dwelling
alternate water source systems where outlets, piping, and system components
are located on the exterior of the building, and there are no connections to the
house plumbing.

(86) UPC Subsection 1501.7 is incorporated into the SPC, and is amended to read as
follows:

1601.7 Minimum Water Quality Requirements. The minimum water quality for
alternate water source systems shall meet the applicable water quality
requirements for the intended application as determined by the Health Officer.

(87) UPC Subsection 1503.9.2 is incorporated into the SPC and is amended to read
as follows:

1503.9.2 Gray Water Pipe and Fitting Materials. Aboveground and
underground building drainage and vent pipe and fittings for gray water systems
must comply with the requirements for aboveground and underground sanitary
building drainage and vent pipe and fittings in this code. These materials shalll
extend not less than 5 feet (1.5 m) outside the building.

(88) UPC Subsection 1505.1 is incorporated into the SPC and is amended to read as
follows:

1505.1 General. The provisions of this section apply to the installation,

construction, alteration, and repair of reclaimed (recycled) water systems
intended to supply uses such as water closets, urinals, trap primers for floor

23



' ORDINANCE
W CITY COUNCIL
e cr o s §9(2022)

A BILL FOR AN ORDINANCE

drains and floor sinks, aboveground and subsurface irrigation, and other uses
approved by the Authority Having Jurisdiction.

(89) UPC Subsection 1602.2 is incorporated into the SPC and is amended to read as
follows:

1602.2 Plumbing Plan Submission. No permit for a rainwater catchment
system shall be issued until complete plumbing plans, with data satisfactory to
the Authority Having Jurisdiction, have been submitted and approved.
Nonpotable rainwater catchment systems must be stamped and signed by a
registered professional mechanical or civil engineer, licensed to perform building
and site plumbing design work, respectively. The registered professional
mechanical or civil engineer is responsible for the design supervision and
construction observation of the nonpotable rainwater catchment systems and
must provide the Authority Having Jurisdiction with a statement indicating that the
as built system complies with the approved plans and requirements of this code.
Nonpotable rainwater catchment systems must be tested and inspected by a
Plumbing Special Inspector.

SECTION 4. This ordinance will become effective as an alternative to the

existing Plumbing Code upon approval. This ordinance will become effective as a
replacement of the existing Plumbing Code and compliance with this code will become

mandatory 90 days after its approval.
'INTROD D BY:
Ore Y ~ou (br)

U

DATE OF INTRODUCTION:

24



ORDINANCE

W 1Ty councrL
CITY AND COUNTY OF HONOLULU
o HONOLULU, HAWAII BILL 3 9 ( 2022 )

A BILL FOR AN ORDINANCE

JUN 14 2022

Honolulu, Hawaii Councilmembers

APPROVED AS TO FORM AND LEGALITY:

Deputy Corporation Counsel

APPROVED this _ day of , 20

RICK BLANGIARDI, Mayor
City and County of Honolulu

25



T | a8ed

"SHWISd € PIUY ,S9p0D
jfemapis pue ‘Buiquinid ‘eouo8|3 ‘Bulpjing

‘speay Jamoys ‘s}aso|d Jajem JO Juswaoe|dal
pue [eaowsal ay) (q) pue ‘josiay) sued

Jo swayshs Buiquinid jo Juswaoejda. Jo jeAowal
ay} Inoyum sxo0|q pue sabeddoys jo Bules)o
ay) (e) :ywuad Buipjing e aiinbal Jou ssop yiom
Bumoljoy ay) ‘uonoes sy Japun jwiad Buipjing
e Buuinbas wouy ydwaxa yiom ay) 0} uonippe uj

RIVIDETe)

Buipjing ejesedas e Bujuie)qo jsaiy Jnoyum
‘auop aq 0] swes sy} asned 03 J0 (q)L ¢

-8l uonosg HOY ul papiuad se 1daoxe spod

siy) Aq paje|nbas waysAs Buiquinid e eoe|dal L'v0L
10} sjuIRd pue s994, 8| Jaydeyn HOY 298 Jo siedal ‘[lejsu) ‘1s)je 0y jnymelun aq |[eys 3| palinbay shued uonoasqgng

‘(.s8insespy

uoneAlssuod Jajepn,)  dINY ‘0 Jeydeyd HOY

Ul sjuswialinbal UORBAIBSUOD JBeM B YIM

Aldwoo [leys sjeuun pue ‘s}ajio} ‘sjeoney Alojene;

‘sjeonej usyoyy ‘spesylomoys Buysixe ‘paoe|da.

"S9INSES|\ UOKBAISSUOD JI "Auedoud Jo Ajases ‘yyesy o) plezey e

Jole ¥ 9oy ‘Juswabeuey Jsjepn | s1eal0 ou op Asy) Jeys pepircid panuiuos Jiedal

0¢ J81deyd HOY ul sjuswalinbal uopeAIasuod J0 ‘agueusiulew ‘asn Jj1ay) saey 0} papiwlad
Jajem ay} 0} WIOJUOI [|leys S|euln pue ‘s})a|io) 8q |leys &poo siy jo uondope ayy Jo swiy 2201
‘sjooney AiojeAe) ‘sjeoney usyoyy ‘speaysemoys 8y} Je aoua)sixa ul A|jnme| swiaysAs Buiguunig suone||eisu| bunsixg uonoasgns

(,opoD Buigwnid

‘uoiuyep 8jelg llemeH ay) jo uondopy,) | 8|0y meu e

pue Auefo apinoud o) sbenbue) g1 Jeydeyn Buippe Aq papuswe s| (,opo) buiquinid,) 0661
‘HOY Jo suoisiroad snoinaid sjelbajul syp3 N|NJOUOH JO S8oURUIPIO PasIneY ‘gl Jaideyn (AT T\ € uojoes

Sjuswipuswe | ‘sjuswipuswe |eso) 0} joaigns ‘gz-/01 29S8 SHH

[e20] Yim apo) Buiquinid aye)s Jo uoidopy Aq paiinbai se ‘epo) Buiquinid s1els 1 1lemeH
:uonesynsne 8y} 1dope 0} sI @dueUlpIO SIy) Jo asodind 8y asoding | uonoeg

SINIWWOD /NOILVYDIFILSNP
[FIVNOLLVY NOLLINOS3a LNIWINIWY ERINIS NOILD3S

34d00 ONISNNTd 8102 OL SIONVHO 0ISOdOdd 40 A¥VININNS




Z | @8ed

"(48pJO 3y} jO JuBWIojUB [BIDIPN[
pue ‘apJQO 8Y} JO 1088 ‘1apIQ 8y} JO JUBUOD)

leaddy 0) 3By — JapIQ JO 10943 — Z'2°901 €290l
's19plQ op-doiS — 7901 uonoasqng
‘uoney) Jo suowwing — z'€'901 ybnouyy
"JUSWSJI0JUD SAlJEJISIUIWPE. PUB [RUILILD ‘(uonnoesoid |euiwu)) sepjeuad £'901 Z2'90L
yioq Joj suoisircid Juawadlojus saysijqelsy :UO[JB[OIA 10 UOI0B.I0YD) JO 920N — Z'901 | J9pJO PUB UOHEBIOIA JO SOOION uonoasqng
‘pajoadsul
aq ||IMm Jey) yJom ay) Butwiopiad u) paajoAul
*9p09 siy} jo suoisiaoid diysuewiom ajqestjdde Jou aJe jey) sjeuotssajoid ubisap pasuadl|
3y} pue suoieoyioads pue sue|d paroidde | Ajsjendordde Aq pswiopad aq jsnw suondadsu)
3y} 0) 2oUBWIOUOD Ul sem uonoadsul eldads | [e1dadg Buiquinid uswyedap ay) JO S82IN0Sal
Buuinbau yiom ay) yeyy Buneys uwodas peubis JO YJom 8y} Jo ainjeu sy} uo paseq Alessaosu
[eul} e ‘rHY 8y} 0} ‘Nwqns [jeys pue paiojdws pawesp usym uonoadsu| |e1oadg Buiquinid
aq ||eys Jom ayi Bulwiopad si0joeuU0D 0] 103[qns aq 0} apo2 siy) Aq pausanob yiom
8y} Jo Juapuadapul ‘siojadsul jeads Buigqunig aanbai Aew uonaipsunr Buiney Apioyiny sy
(pappy) uonoadsu| [eeds Buiqunid
‘suonoadsul
aAnnedal Joy ajesuadwod o) Ayjiqe ay) ‘uoioadsui o) Apeal sl YJom
a9)esodiodul 0} papuawe S| 9pod 31BIS/OdN BUL | Yons Jeyy uonoipsuns Buiney Ajuoyiny ayy Ajnou
0} yuued e Aq pazuoyine yJom 8y} Bulop uosied
‘pajoadsul aq 0} SI JIOM 8y} aloyaq 8y Jo Ainp 8y} 2q ||eys )j :90I10N PaduUBApPY
sAep Buniiom om) uey) ssaj jou usalb aq |leys
uoneoyou pue ‘uonedylaa asusl| Buiqunid ‘uopoadsui ‘suonjoadsuyj |e1oads 12501
10} suoisiaoid ppe 0} pue sjuswalinbay Joy Apeai s| yJom yans jey) rHY ays Ayou Buiquin|d ‘suonoadsuiey uonoasqns
aonjou aoueape Alg snoinaid o) 1senbal | o) yuuad e Ag pazuoyine yiom ay) Buiop uosiad ‘921J0N 9ouUBApY ny} £'2°soL
8Uj) 8SIA8. 0) papUSWE S| UOIIIISANS SIY | 8y} Jo Ainp ayy aq |jeys )} "sisenbay uonoadsuy| ‘sysanbay uonoadsy| uonoasqns

*SOOUBUIPIO JO SMB| JBYI0 Aue Jo

8p09 8] JO sjuswialinbal JaYjo sy} JO UOREIOIA
Ul SUOP 8q 0] YJIOM 1o} uonezuoyine Juesb

0} pawaap a4 jou Jleys (q)}'¢-g) uoldeS HOY
Jspun sjuawaiinbai ywiad wouy uondwaxy

‘sjusuodwod welsAs Buiquinid
Jayjo pue ‘sadid ‘sanjea Jo Juswabueliesl
Jo Juswade|dal 3y} JNOYIM S}aoNey) pue




€ | a8ed

"SA|BA Jajemyoeq

8y ybnouy) ebieyosip Jou jjeys uoneas|e

POO|} 8SBq 38U} SAOGE |9A8| JOO}4 B JE P3)edo)
sainxi4 °|lem 1oue)xa Buliping ay) ybnouy)
Buissed aui| o61eydsIp yoes Ul aAeA Jsjemydeq
ojjewolne ue yyum paddinbas si wajsAs abeujeip
8U} SS8|UN UOIIBAS|S POOJj 8skq U} dA0ge

100} BUO 1SED| ] JO UOIBAS|S UR JB 8]BuILLIS)
Ileys sbuiuado adid jpy *Aouehonq jo spoays
8y} Buipnjoul ‘sessalls pue speo| JIWBUAPOIPAY
pue ofje1SoJpAyY Isisal 0} paj|ejsul pue

paubisep aq |leys uoljeAs|a poojj aseq ay} mojeq
pejeoo| swajsAs Buiquinld -Buipooy Buunp
sjuauodwod JIay} UIYIM S)|NWNIoe J0 ISjuUd
Jou ||m Ja1eMm Jey) Os pajjejsul pue paubisep

8q 1snw v g 1a1deyd HOY Ui paynusp ease

‘Sieyjew pajejas psezey | abuly pooy Jo ‘ease Aempooys ‘eale piezey pooy ¥'L0¢

poo|4 10} Y12 J8ideyd HOY O} 8ouaIaal sayely [e1oads ul pajedo) ale Jey) swaisAs Buiquinid sealy pJezeH poo|4 uonoasqgnsg
"8p0J Siy} Ul pasn se Jaaulbu3g [uOISSBl0ld | "S}]oaNydIy adeospueT] pue SI0ASAING ‘SIoeNydIY

paJslsibay, Joy uoniuysp ayy Buippe ‘stoauibug |euoissajold 9y Jerdeys Jepun Jaauibug 0022

AQ Ddn pue apo) Buiquinid ejelg spuswy IlemMeH JO 3JelS 8y} ul pasuagy| Jesuibus uy [euoissajold paiaisibay uonoesgng
"uonejues pue
‘Bunjood ‘Buidasis Joy saiuswe yym paddinbe
pue suosiad 810w JO SUO O} SUCIBPOWWOIIE

“Bulllemq, 1oy uomuyep sy} Buippe Buill apiroud o} papusu s jey) soeld 0'902

AQ Ddn pue apo) Buiquinjd 8jelg spuswy Jajo Io ‘Juswyede ‘ssnoy e sueaw Buljemg (peppy) Bullemq uoloesgng
‘'soAjeA dojs uolssaldwod

" OABA [04JU0D, 10} uoiuysp ay} Buippe SapNioul Yolym ‘Jsiem Jo ajel moy sy abueyo 0502

AQ Ddn pue apo) Buiquinid 81e)S Spuswy ued Ualym sAjeA Jo adA) Aue si aAeA [0)u09 (peppy) aAlep [osuo) uonoasqgng

‘8poo Buip|ing 10} 0'v0¢C

uoRiuysp ay} 4o} 9| J8ydeyd HOY seouals)ey pspuawe se ‘(1)|"L-91 § HOY Ul pauyep sy (peppy) apo9 Buipiing uopoasgng

uogolpsunp 0°c0C

"9p02 Sy} Ul 8SN 8y} sayLelD

Buiney Aoyny 1oy suopiulep sepIAOId

uonaipsunp BuineH Ayouyny

uoioasqns




v | a8ed

‘'S9IIAISS pue S84

Buipnjou| syuswalinbay ainjonselu] SHIOA
olgnd 1 Jeideyd HOY Jo suawalinbal ay)
Yim souepiodoe Ul ‘youelqg |oauos) Aiojeinbay
,S90IAISS |ejuSWUOIIAUT JO Juswleda(

ay) Aq ywuad ob1eyosIp Ja)eMa)sem [elysnpul ue
alinbal Aew wae)sAs uonoaa|joo 191eMaisem s A0
3} 0} po)OBUUOD SWS)SAS Jamas Alejues |y

"SSOIAISS [BJUSWILIOIIAUT JO Juswpedaqg
ay) Aq pejdope sjuswalinbai esueusUIEW pue

*SUONIBUUOD uBisap auy yim Ajldwod ysnw §| 18ydeyn HON
[eso)e| Jomes sssippe 0} sasodind jeuonew.ojul Japun ywiad abieyosip Jayemaisem jeusnpul (peppe)
Joj yuswipuatue snolaaid woly abenbue| pajepdn ue alinbal jey) swa)sAs Jamas Aleluesg sjuLed £°90¢
9jelodiooul 0} pappe si uonaasqns siy| (peppvy) abieyosiq aisep) |erisnpu| suoljrasqgng

'8poo

siy} Jo sjuswadinbal sy} pue ue|d uonoadsul

pue Bunsa) papiwqgns a8y} Yjm 80UBpIOIoe Ul

pajoadsul pue pajsa) aq |m ubisep passauibus

"ubisep pasesuibus | saneussije syl ‘subisep passsuibus sajeuls)je
9jeussyje ay) Joj uonoadsul [eloads apnjoul Buiajoaul Yiom 1oy paanbal aq |Im £°2°S0 L 9'6'10¢€
0} papusuwe s| apo) Bulquinid s1e1S/0dN uonoag ul payloads se ‘suoloadsul jeloadg Bunsa| pue uonoadsui uonoasqns

‘uone|ieisul panoidde ay) jo Led sem

ubisep paisaulbus aAjjeuls)fe Ue jey) aedlpul

lleys spJooad jiwiad Jusuewlad pue pulad

8yl ‘uonedidde ywuad uoyoniSUOD BY) UO

pajou s! )l Jey) os ubisap palesuibus aAleuls)e

ue si ‘Josiay} ped 1o ‘waysAs Buiquinid

8y} jey) syuswnoop ubisap ay) uo a1eslpul

"8po92 sIy) Aq papuajul uonosioid lleys soaulbus |euoissajoid paisysibes sy

10 [aA9] 8y} apiroad pue seofjoeld Buuesuibus

pajdecoe 0) wiojuod ysnw subisap asay ‘subisap

})senbau ubisep paisauibus sjeuss)e ue ‘piodas | paissuibus saneuld)R Buiajoaur syuued Buipjing
uo ‘Juswinoop 0} 1sauibul esiueyos| pasuadl Joj suonesiidde oy Ajdde [im Bumojio) ey} ‘gL 1'S'1L0E
llemeH e 10} suesaw e apiaoid 0} papuswe Odn | Je1deyd HOY Jo sjuswainbai syy o) uoippe uj suoneoydde jiwlad uonossqng




S | 98ed

papirod pue Alddns Jajem Jo weyshs panosdde
ue 0] pa)osuu02 aq |leys sainyxy Buiquinid |y,
:S9}je)Ss 9oUBUSS puodss (|) "eied-qnsg
‘sainixid (p) "eled ‘uonejUeS G'p-/Z UONORS

Alddns se1eM BY) 0}

‘apoQ BuisnoH /z Jeydeyn HOY Yum Ajldwios o} paj08uu09 Jou ale pue uojjesado JiBy) 1o} Jsjem uondaoxy — 2109
paiinbai Apeauje sainyxy Buiqun|d asn sjeAld alinbai Jou op jey) sainixiy paysi] :uondaoxy | padinbay Jsjepn PO pue JoH uonossqng
"sa1ouednodo
adA) A|qwasse snouea 104 ,'salljioe Alejues
wnuiuiiy 6-1 -1 L, UohOdg ‘uonejues ||
Jeydey) HOQ seaholdwa Joy sapioey buiqunid
saJinbai uoneyueg |-/ | Je1dey) ‘spiepuels
uonaNIISuo) € Hed ‘yjesH pue Aysjes
leuonednad( JO UoISIAIQ  dIIgnS ‘suonejey
[euysnpu| pue JogeT Jo yuswpuedaq Z1 o)L ¥vH
"UOIONJISUOD MaU JO} "apo) Buip|ing ay) ui paanbal Jaqunu
Rouednoo0 jo adA) uo paseq sainyxy Buiquinid wnwjuiw ay} ul pue Aouednaoso Buipjing jo salnixi4 0'ZZy
10 Jaquinu wnwiuiw sasinbal apo9 Buipping sy 8dA} ay) Jo) papiroid aq [leys saunixy Buiquinid | paJinbay jo JaquinN wnwiulpy uonoasqng
"ysnjj Jod Jayem Jo (sial| g'¥)
suojieb gZ'1 JO swnjoA Ysny WnWIXew e saAey
[leys s}aso[0 J9)em pajeAllor SAlBA Jajawoysn|4
‘ysny Jod Jayem Jo (synuiwy/siay)
8°9) suojeb gz'| paadxe 0} Jou uondwnsuod rArAl R 2
WNWIXew e aAey Jleys S}asojo Jajepp $)950|)) Jajem uoioasqns
PoIBANJY SAIBA Ja)aWoysn|4 pue gLy
'S82IN0SA. [BINJEU JO UOIJBAIBSUOD ‘(ed) Zgs e wy1 g'9) 1sd 08 {(s1980|D uonoasqgng
Joj saioljod aanesisiviwpe s A0 ay) ssalppe 1e (wdb) synuiw sad suojeb g'| uey) siow jou IS)EAA PUB DPEBYIEMOYS) ‘2'80v
0} papuawe si 8po) Buiquinjd 91e1S/OdN | JO 9.l MO WNWIXEW & SARY ||_YS SPesyJomoys uondwnsuoy) Jaye uonoasgng
‘8poD uonejiues
JusWysIiqe)s3 pood pue adIAIeg poo
Z\| Jaideyd ‘HOQ Ul paIanod ale sjuswysigelse
Buipuey-pooy 1oy syuswaiinbal ey
‘sjuswysi|gelse Bulipuey-pooy Jo suonelssdo ay) ‘pajsIep ale ‘0ds (paejoq)
seje|nbas youeig uoneyues ‘HOQ 1ey) sjedipul 8y} Aq paydope ‘Odn 8yi Jo |°/ L€ uonoasgns sjuswysi|qels3 (VAR
0} papuswe s| apo) Buiquinid s1e1S/OdN Buipnpour ‘syuswysiigels3 BuljpueH-poo- BuypueH poo4 uonossgng




9 | afeg

‘e yiesH ayy Aq paydope sjuswalinbai

‘sjuswysijge}ss buijpuey-pooy Jo suoneisdo ay} yum Aldwoo jsnw syuswiysiigelse €90/
ay) sajenbas yosueug uoneliues ‘HoOQ 90IAI9S POOJ PUEB SUBYDYY [BIDIOWIWIOD Ul SYUIS SHUIS [BloJBWIWOD suooasqns
*9po03 SIY) JO G019 UOND8S Ul papircid se Jo
ulaJay) paquosap se pazis aq Aew $'(19 djge
‘uondIpsunl gSag Ajde|2 0) pue apoo snoiaasd Jo abuel ay) ulyum swaysAs ‘A|ddng Jerepp *SWwaysAg uonnquysiq 019
wo.j suotsircld ajelodiooul 0) papusy Jo pieog sy Aq paJinbal asimiayo se jdeoxg pue A|ddng ss)ep Buizig suoloasqng
‘Alquiasse aAjeA
%o8yo pue dwnd 18}s00q Yum swaisAs (9)
"Alquissse
SAleA %08yd uuele yum swaishg () ¥1°5°€09
*S92INOP SAIJBUIB)E SpN|oUl O} papuswy :sa21nep Buimoljo) ayy Buippe Aq papuswy | SWalsAg ali4 WO} UoID8)0I4 uonoasqng
" WIsAs Jajem Ajunwiwioo-uou, B Jo Wa)sAs
Jojem Ajlunwwoo, e s1 walsAs Jayem olgnd
v ‘pejesado io paumo Apignd Jo Ajeyeand aq
Aew wa)sAs Jsjem algnd v "WI)SAS Yons ypm
uonoauuod Ul Ajuewd pasn aJe yolym |oJjuod
yons Japun jou sai|ioe} abeloys Juswiealjald 1o
uono9||03 Auy () pue ‘waejsAs yons jo Jojessdo
8y} JO |04ju02 JapuN SajI0B} UoINQU)SIP pue
‘abelo)s yuswieay) ‘uoio9||oo Auy (}) :sepnjoul
wu9) yong “Jeah ayj Jo Ino shAep Axis jses| je
Aliep sjenpialpul aAy-Ajuam) jses) je jo abeloae
ue sanles Apenbal Jo SuoI0aUU0D 92IAIeS
uaa)l} 1ses] Je sey Wa)sAs ay) JI saoueAaAU0D
pajonssuod Jayo sadid ybnouy; ‘uoipdwinsuos "J921JJ0 Y)jeay ay) Aq paulep se Swa)sAs Jajem
uewny Joj Jajem sapiaoid yolym waysAs ol|gnd Se paulsp Jou aie Jey} SWa)sAs Jajem
e sueaw  Wa)sAs Jayem olqnd, * SWaIsAS Jaje 0} Aldde swa)sAs Jajem aleAllq "SWa)SAs Jsjem
oliand o} Buneiey seiny 0z Jeydeyd, HOQ | N1eYs Jo Ayjiqejod ayy Butuleyurew oy sjgisuodsal (PoppY)
Jo syuawausnbau sy} Aq paje|nbai ase Auadoid aJe swa)sAs Jajem sjeaud Jo sisuMQ ' 109
ajeAud ulyIm swalsAs Jajem dljgnd 810N (poppy) SWasAS J9je A\ B1eAld uonoasqng

~/uonesado jewiou
sy Joj Auessaoau Jajem Bujuuni pjod pue joy ypm




L | 98ed

VLS

Vd4N 03 Juensind uoousal sABMIIB)S JOLIDIXD
apoo Buipjing pue juswpuawe pajsanbal
Auedwo) ses) ajelodiooul 0) pepuswy

pue anda|s ay) pue buidid seb ay) usamiaq
saoeds Je|nuue ay) ‘anas|s adid aAyoslold e Ul
paseous s| buidid alsypn “sluspol pue ‘sjoesul
‘19)eMm Jo Aijus ay) Juaaaid o) uonesduad
JoLIg)Xa ay) Jo uiod 3y} Je 99UaI8jWNAD

S}l punole pajeas a4 |leys buidid sy}
‘suopyesljdde yons Joy paaoidde jeusyewl yaul

ue ypm Buiddeim Jo Bupeos Aq uoisoliod Jsuiebe
payosjoud aq (leys Buidid ayy ‘|jlem Joua)xe

ue ybnouy) Buissed aisypn ainjonus Jo apelb
aA0ge (Ww gGl) sayoul xis Jses) je 1day aq |leys
Buidid seb pasodxa ||y -abewep |eoisAyd woly
pajoajoud aq |im )l alaym pajeoo| pue pauoddns
Ajainoas aq |leys punoib saoqe pajeisul Suidid

"SWOO0J J9JaW J1108|8 Jo Jajeay ‘Jajioqg ‘sulbua ul
10 ‘SABMUIE]S JOLIB)XS JO JOLIBIUI JOPUN ‘MOPUIM B
Japun ps)eao} 8q 10U ABW SIS)OW Sew) "AIsAljep
40 Jui0d 8y} J0 uoneo| BY) pue ‘SPUBWApP peo|
SNoLEBA 83U} ‘seyouelq Juasayip jo azis ay} ‘bBuidid
J0 uoneoo| pasodoud ay) moys ysnw ueld sy
‘uoipe|eysul yym buipaasoud asojeq ueld Buidid

e aJanbals Aew uonoipsung BuiaeH Ajoyiny sy

Burdig yo uonejjeisu
pue
‘swaysAg Buidid jo uonejeisu|

Z2olel
uonoesqng
pue L'g0cC1
uonoesqng

‘joodssao
Joj asn Alepuooas Buimoyje Juswpusue
snoiaald apnoul 0} papusawe S| Uoioasqgns siy |

‘uonaIpsunr Buiney

Auoyiny ayi Aq panoidde uaym abieyosip dwnd
uim dwns abemas e 10} J0}daoal MOISAO ue se
pasn aq 0} pamojfe si |00dssao pauopueqe uy
:uondaoxg

(poppe)

"(peppe)
uondeox3 — sjd abedesg
pue ‘syue] ondeg ‘sjoodssan

TAAAA
uonoasqns

'$S9X0q
9AeA JO sadA) Jayjo 10} MOjje 0} papusuy

‘yuswpedwoo

panoidde Jayjo 1o JaA0D 9|qeAowal

pazis Ajo1enbape ue yum payy ud Aluosew

B Ul pasojoud aq jjeys ‘pasodxs Ajsnonunuod
ssajun ‘pue Jiedsl pue uonoadsul Joj 8|qIssadoe
aq |Im Aay) alaym pajedo| aq ||eys uoioes

siY} Ag paainbal s821A8p |BDIUBYOBW JBYJ0 pue
‘S)uUe} JIe ‘s10s$aIdUIoD ‘SI0JoW ‘SuUoIUN ‘SAeA
l1eq Aem||n} ‘sanjeA a)eb ‘sanjea Jajemyoeg

(ydeibeied
1841}) SSAJBA Jojemyory

9'0LL
suoloasqng




8 | @8ed

"SWId)SAS 82IN0S JoJeM Bjeuss)je

Jo syuswaunbal ay) pue sueld panoidde sy
yum saljdwiod wae)sAs ying se ay) j1ey) paijuan
Alleuosiad aney Aay) ey Buiestpul uonoipsunp
BuineH Ajloyiny ay) o) Juswalels e apirosd
‘uone|dwos joafosd uodn ‘ysnw pue wesAs
90In0S Islem 9jeuls)je ay} JO UONBAISS]O

pue ubisap sy} 4o} a|qisuodsal ale sieauibus
IIAID pue [edlueydsw jeuoissajold sy
"SjuUsSWINJ0p UoNdNIISUOd pue sueld u payioads
8 }SNW WS)SAS 90IN0OS J9)eM s)jeuld)e

ue ul pasn sbumy pue ‘Buidid ‘syjusuodwo)
“yiom ubisap Buiqunid sys pue Buipjing
wuopad 0} pasusol] Jeaulbus [IAID 10 [eoluByoaw

Joj uonoadsu |eroads Suiquinid pue ‘siesulbus Jeuoissajouid paisysibal e Aq paubissp (swajsAs 20inos Jajem 2 L0SL
[IAID 10 [eOlUBYDSW ainbal 0) papuswy 94 ISNW SWISAS 82iN0S I9)EM djeuId)y ajeuisye) ubisaq welsAg uonoasqgng
"‘Aouednooo pue ‘uonedljisselp
pJezey ‘uolonJisuod Jo adA) uo paseq

@po) Buipjing sy} u pasanod ale Buiddoysauy (parojeq)
Joj syjuswaJinbal 8y} ssneoaq pajejeg "Alaaijua syl ui payajeq uonoslold doig ali4 y1 Jeydeyn

“J0}00dsu| [e1vadg Buiquin|d e Aq

pajoadsu; pue palss) aq 1SNW SWa)SAS wnnsea

pue seb |edips|y “9po3 sIy} JO sjuswa.Inba.

Jayjo pue sueid parosdde ayi yum saiidwios

waysAs J|Ing se ay} Jey; payuea Ajleuosiad aaey

Asy) ey Buneoiput uonoipsunp Buiney Apoyiny

ay} 0} Juswa)e)s e apinold ‘uons|dwod yoafoid

uodn ‘Isnw wa)sAs winnoea pue seb [esipsw

8y} JO UOIeAISSJO UOIJONIISUD pue ubisep

ay) 1oy sjqisuodsal Jasuibua |IAID 10 |ediueyosaw

[euoissejoud paltelsibas ay| “lesulbus

[IAID JO [ediueydaw |euolssayold palsysibal

Aq paubis pue padwejs aq 1snw Swa)sAs
"swiaysAs wnnoea pue seb [esipsw wnnoeA pue seb [eaipaw lo} sueid ‘g Jeydeyn (poppYy)
Joj uonoadsul [eloads pue Jaaulbua IAID Jo HOY Aq pasodwi sjuswanbai 0y uonippe u) v'6LEL
jedlueysaiu pasuadl| yjog asinbal 0} papuaiuy (poppy) jeaosddy uonossqns

"pojess aq

lleys Buiuado |lem sy} pue aa8s|s 8y} usamiaq




6 | @8ed

"swie)sAs Juawyoles Jajemuiel sjqejoduou

"Jojoadsuy [eioadg Buiquinid e Aq peyoadsut pue
Pa1sa} 8q 1SN SWa)sAS Juawyo)ed Jajemulel
3|qejoduoN ‘spo9 siy} Jo sluswalnbal

pue sueld poaosdde ay; yym saljdwiod

walsAs jjing se sy} jey} buesipul Juswale)s

B Yum uonolpsunr Buire Ajuouiny sy

apiacid JsSnw pue swajsAs JuaWwyoled Jsjemulel
d[gejoduou ay) JO UOBAISSYO LOIONJISUOD

pue uoisinadns ubisap ay) Joj ajqisuodsau

s1 J@auibua [IAID JO |edIUBYISW [eUOISSE)0Id
pasaysiBal ay] -Aloanoadsal “yiom ubisep
Buiquinid ays pue Buipjing wiopad 0} pasussl|
‘Josuibua [IA19 Jo [eojueyosW [euoissayo.d
paJa)sibal e Aq paubis pue padwe)s eq

ISNW sWaIsAs JusWyoled Jsjemulel ajqejoduon
‘panoidde pue papiwgns ussq aAey ‘uogolpsun
Buiney Ajuoyiny ay) 0} Aiojoeysies ejep yum

Joj uonosdsul [erads pue ‘siesuibus ‘sueld Buiquin|d s)ejdwoa un panssi aq |leys 2'2091
[IA19 Jo [ediueyosw Buuinbal papuswy wa)sAs Juswyoyed Jejemulel e 1oy yuwlad oN uoissiugng ue|d bBuiqunig uofnoasqnsg
19010 YlleaH ay) AqQ pauiuLislep se
uonedldde papusajul ay) o} sjuswaiinbal Ajjenb
‘uonolpsunp buiney Ajoyiny syj Aq paulusiep | Jejem sjqesidde sy J9sW jjeys swajsAs a0inos sjuawainbay 2°10S1
se Ajjenb Jajem aousiajal 0} papusuy Jajem ajeussyie Joj Ayjenb Jojem wnwiuiw ay | Ajenp 1arepn winwiuiy uonoasqng

‘Buiquinid asnoy

8Y} 0] SUOI}OBUUCD OU aJe aiay) pue ‘Bulpyng
3} Jo JolI8)Xd 8y} U Paleoo| ale sjusuodwod
wa)sAs pue ‘Buidid ‘sjepino ateym swajshs
90In0s Jajem sjeuls)je Buljiemp Ajiwey ajbuls Joy
paJinbai jou s| 1esuibus [euoissejold paus)sibal
ay} ‘yop Jeydey) SHH Jo sjuswalnbal
Bursuadi] wouy ydwaexa 108fosd usypa

:uondeoxg

“10}08dsu| [eloadg
Buiquinid e Aq pajoadsur pue psjss)} aq jsnw
SWe)sAs 82.n0s Jajem sjeula)ly ‘8pod Siy)




